IMPERIAL COUNTY SHERIFF, PUBLIC WORKS, FLEET, FIRE, & FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

SAFETY SUPPLIES BID RECAP
FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026
RFQ 25-0257

ALL SOURCES ALL PRODUCTS LLC

VIDL SOURCING LLC

DESCRIPTION ITEM # PRICING COMMENTS ITEM # PRICING COMMENTS
3 GALLON IGLOO OR KOOL CAN 431 57.81 NO BID
IGLOO OR KOOL CAN SPOUTS (SPIGOTS) 24009 12.97 NO BID
CLASS Il SAFETY VEST: MED, LARGE, XLARGE 303-V100LY 10.40 PIP 303-V100 Economy Type R Class 3 Dual NO BID
Sized Value Mesh Safety Vest
CLASS IIl SAFETY VEST: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL, 6XL, 7XL 303-V100LY 10.40 PIP 303_,\/100 Economy Type R Class 3 Dual NO BID
Sized Value Mesh Safety Vest
SUN SHIELDS FOR HARD HATS (SMOKE &

OPAQUE WHITE TO FIT MSA V-GARD HAT) AS5-M A5G NO BID

SAFETY BELT, PROFLEX 2000, V-SHAPE DESIGN, STRETCHABLE BIAS BINDING 11284 -L 60.83
W/ZIGZAG STITCHING, ADJ WOVEN ELASTIC SUSPENDERS, 11285 - XL 71.06 NO BID

SIZES: LARGE, XLARGE, XXLARGE 11286 - XXL 71.06

WHITE HARD HAT MSA V-GARD PROTECTIVE HARD HAT
MEETS TYPE 1 HELMET BY ANSI Z89 1-2003 463942 B3 NO BID
SWEAT BANDS SNAP ON HARD HAT SWEAT BAND,
100% COTTON,MACHINE WASHABLE 33v784 BB NO BID
SAFETY FIRST STICKERS SELF ADHESIVE DECAL WEATHER, )
UV RAY RESISTANT FO OUTDOOR USE 614609935696 6.55 4 Stickers Per Pack NO BID
HARD HAT INSET PADS MIRA-COOL HARD HAT
INSERT PAD OCCU-968-NAVY-EA 21.23 NO BID
HARD HAT LINERS FITS OVER HARD HAT TO

SHADE NECK AND BLOCK SUN & UV-RAYS, MACHINE WASHABLE 0K-5057009-Y e NO BID

FIRST AID KIT, OSHA APPROVED ASAPLFAO-112 8.26

PERSONS: 5, 10, 25 ASAP2 9160-RC 20.08 URG-3681 17.85 Serves 5 - 25 People

ASAP3 54629 30.80

BEE STING SWABS 5000 9.43 Sting Kill Anesthetic Swabs 5 NO BID




LEATHER GLOVES, COW GRAIN FULL LEATHER GLOVE SLIP ON,

RADNOR Small Natural Grain Cowhide

UNLINED: SMALL, MEDIUM, LARGE, XLARGE 64057443 8.20 Palm/Split Cowhide Back Leather Unlined NO BID
Drivers Gloves
SAFETY GLASSES JACKSON SAFETY NEMESIS SLEEK SPORTY STYLE SOFT TOUCH
TEMPLES LIGHT WEIGH CONSTRUCTION, SINGLE LENS WRAY AROUND STYLE 25688 8.20 NO BID
PROTECTION W/NECK CORD. MEETS ANSI Z89-1 IMPACT STANDARD
NEMESIS SAFETY GLASSES, BLACK FRAME, CLEAR LENS 25676 5.03 NO BID
HAND SANITIZER, POCKET SIZE OZ SIZE
(PLEASE STATE OUNCE SIZE YOU ARE QUOTING) 3901-36-BWL el 10z- 36 Pack NO BID
EZ UP SPEED SHELTER, INSTATNT, PORTABLE SHELTER, E-Z UP 10’ x 10’ Commercial ONE-
COMMERICAL GRADE (PLEASE STATE SIZE YOU ARE QUOTING) ENV3WH1O0RB 2IBEE UP™ Canopy NO BID
: 112.03 Assorted - 1.3 Oz 100 Per Pack
SQWINCHER POWDER DRINK MIX 016044AS S ‘ 4 c NO BID
24 PACK 1.32 0Z, 32 PACK 21 0Z, 32 PACK 21 OZ $224.60 Lemon Lime - 23.83 Oz 32 Per Pack
NEMESIS SAFETY GLASSES, BLACK FRAME, CLEAR LENS 25676 5.03 NO BID

LOW BID
SECOND LOWEST BID




