
DESCRIPTION PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS QTY

CORELESS ROLL LINERS, NATURAL COLOR, 24" X 24", 8 MICRONS,                      

7-10 GAL CAPACITY, 20 ROLLS OF 50 EACH, 1000 LINERS/CS
17.00 CAN-H-2424-8 17.55 137671 12.85 S242406N 6 Microns 15.25 UPC242408N 22.97 10805191 16.68 INT-2424-REG 21.27 R2424N8

100             

CASES

CORELESS ROLL LINERS, NATURAL COLOR, 40" X 48", 16 MICRONS, 

40-45 GAL CAPACITY, 10 ROLLS OF 25 EACH, 250 LINERS/CS
24.50 CAN-H-4048-16 24.45 137751 26.55 S404816N 23.75 UPC404816N 35.70 10805274 24.24 INT-4048-X-HVY 34.12 R4048N16

100                

CASES

CAN LINER, CLEAR, 30" X 37", 10MIC, 20-30 GAL, 500/CS 18.90 CAN-H-3037 19.35 800005 20.76 S303710N 18.38 UPC303710N 32.93 100099482 18.34 INT-3037-MED 21.59 EC3037N10
75           

CASES

CAN LINER, CLEAR, 24" X 31", .4 MIL, 12-16 GAL, 500/CS 42.92 538926 17.38 158550 18.01 IMP2432N 24" x 32" 15.25 UPC24314 24.73 10957693 17.24 INT-2433-MED 1000/Case 23.00 LR243104C500
50                

CASES

CAN LINER, BLACK, 40" X 46", 1.7 MIL, 40-45 GAL, 100/CS 25.02 404617100 23.40 158590 21.81 ECI404615K 40" x 46", 1.5 MIL 17.25 UPC40461-7 35.06 10961209 21.82 INT-4046-SUPER
150                

CASES

28 QT BLACK WASTEBASKET 15.00 730118 8.45 281801 8.12 9828-BLK 7.25 100421721 9.69 BWK28QTWBBLA
50               

EACH

ROUND TRASH CAN, 44 GAL, BLACK 56.60 475TCRND44BK 39.50 320044 Gray 46.95 8844-BLK 50.66 10390163 69.21 FG264360BLA
7                    

EACH

ROUND TRASH CAN, 44 GAL, BLUE 59.00 475RB44BLREC 48.55 8844-BL 50.66 N/A 69.21 264307
7                    

EACH

HUGGER TRASH CAN, 23 GAL, BLACK, GRAY, OR BLUE 41.25 47WH23CBK 34.69 832202 39.15 8823-GY 40.65 N/A 30.41 PLTC023R
50                

EACH

BLUE NITRILE POWDER/LATEX FREE DISPOSABLE GLOVES,                 

5 MIL., 100/BOX, BETTER TOUCH, SMALL
4.65 79065601 3.45 124755 3.18 1408644S 5.62 20062050 3.60 N/A 4.70 N52S

150  

BOXES

BLUE NITRILE POWDER/LATEX FREE DISPOSABLE GLOVES,                  

5 MIL., 100/BOX, BETTER TOUCH, MEDIUM
4.65 79065600 3.45 124799 3.18 1408644M 5.62 20062049 3.60 N/A 4.70 N52M

250  

BOXES

BLUE NITRILE POWDER/LATEX FREE DISPOSABLE GLOVES,                       

5 MIL., 100/BOX, BETTER TOUCH, LARGE
4.65 79065599 3.45 124794 3.18 1408644L 5.62 20062048 3.60 N/A 4.70 N52L

250  

BOXES

BLUE NITRILE POWDER/LATEX FREE DISPOSABLE GLOVES,                      

5 MIL., 100/BOX, BETTER TOUCH, X LARGE
4.65 79065602 3.45 224794 3.18 1408644X 5.62 20062048 3.60 N/A 4.70 N52XL

250  

BOXES

GLOVES 100% NATURAL LATEX, POWDER FREE,                                         

10 BX/CS, SMALL
50.86 79065605 38.50 124800 21.80 1408908S 44.77 20062030 42.00 N/A 1000/Case 40.65 62323PFXS

10              

CASES

GLOVES 100% NATURAL LATEX, POWDER FREE,                                       

10 BX/CS, MEDIUM
50.86 79065604 38.50 124801 21.80 1408608M 44.77 20062029 42.00 N/A 1000/Case 40.65 62323PFXM

10              

CASES

GLOVES 100% NATURAL LATEX, POWDER FREE,                                     

10 BX/CS, LARGE
50.86 79065603 38.50 124802 21.80 1408608L 44.77 20062025 42.00 N/A 1000/Case 40.65 62323PFL

70                

CASES

GLOVES 100% NATURAL LATEX, POWDER FREE,                                    

10 BX/CS, X LARGE
50.86 79065606 38.50 124803 21.80 1408608SX 44.77 20062031 42.00 N/A 1000/Case 40.65 62323PFXL

10            

CASES

LOW BID

SECOND LOWEST BID

PLASTIC, LINERS, & GLOVES BID RECAP

IMPERIAL COUNTY SHERIFFS, PROBATION, FACILITIES, & FIRE DEPARTMENT

RFQ 25-0256

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026

ALL SOURCES ALL PRODUCTS LLC
DESERT VALLEY SERVICES INC                                                                        

(FULTON DISTRIBUTING)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO LLCVERITIV INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION
IMPERIAL VALLEY DISTRIBUTING                                                                                   

(PADRE USA)
UNIPAK CORP

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


