
DESCRIPTION PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS PRICE SKU COMMENTS QTY

BATH TISSUE- PACIFICA 250, SYMPHONY, BROWN BOX TOILET 

TISSUE 2-PLY, 96 ROLLS/500 SHEETS, AT LEAST 45 % POST 

CONSUMER RECYCLED 4.3"X3.5" DOMESTIC

53.71
MRC16466C

T
48.14 80250 37.75 4050 36.79 666540 39.34 KL-850173 59.84 851167

600             

CASES

C-FOLD PAPER TOWELS, 12/200 SHEET/CS 19.47 GJ021120 31.25 P050B 23.11 80765 19.99 858001 17.10 AG-151 33.84 850045 White Multifold, 16/250
20                

CASES

FACIAL TISSUE, NATURA, 30-100 SHEET BOX/CASE 15.91 GJ026100 20.33 VBFACIAL 18.08 US4060 17.01 666559 38.44 PC4741 34.13 855606 Premium Cubrero 2 Ply, 36/96+
80           

CASES

SINGLE FOLD TOWEL, NATURAL SYMPHONY,                                       

330 SHEETS/PKG, 12 PKG/CS
21.94 GJ021020 24.02 2008 21.77 80745 4000/Case 20.57 592400 18.02 KL-850167 27.13 850183 12 Packs Of 334/Case

8                

CASES

BLUE WINDSHIELD SINGLE FOLD TOWEL,                                                                

2 PLY, 224 SHEETS/PKG, 10 PKG/CS
43.21 KCC05123 40.19 BWK6191 34.96 80747 4000/Case 29.50 165990 51.56 192122 79.40 850040 6/800

8                

CASES

ROLL TOWELS, HARDWOUND NATURAL, 12/350' ROLLS/CS 33.00 GJ022200 32.87 835BT20 26.13 4019 25.00 455666 20.30 KL-855209 29.95 855209
100                

CASES

TALL FOLD DISPENSER NAPKINS, 1-PLY,                                                                            

7 X 13.5, 10000/CARTON
89.39 KCC98710 37.60 VBTFN 32.60 3030 32.00 635000 36.12 1845PBSIFS 51.75 111292 12/800

40                

CASES

WHITE HARDWOUND ROLL TOWELS, 12/600'/CS 41.63 GJ022700 46.16 H065 40.82 4014 42.88 157472 27.00 KL-850088 6/800 80.18 850168
150                

CASES

OPTIMA/SYMPHONY ULTRA -                                                        

MULTIFOLD WHITE TOWELS, 16/250/CS
32.44 GJ021100 21.80 43513 24.55 80270 22.40 666755 22.22 KL-853796 36.23 850232

25                

CASES

PAPER TOWEL DISPENSER- UNIVERSAL 29.28 VBTTDSMFB 48.37 71254338A 41.10 KL-850185 81.64 850631
10                    

EACH

BROWN PAPER BAG #6, 500/CS 18.45 VB6SOB 16.35 433BR6BGC 15.69 136270 11.10 6BIFS 25.83 850406
180                    

BALES

WHITE PAPER BAGS #6, 500/CS 23.88 VB6SOBW 21.80 433W6BGC 19.95 114631B 16.10 6WIFS 28.78 850407
80                  

BALES

BROWN GROCERY BAG #57, 500/CS 59.88 VB1657 50.90 433BR1657SACK 65.00 165447 Special Order Item 42.90 QH9106 55.92 850457
80                

CASES

BROWN PAPER BAG #25, 500/CS 34.83 VB25SOB 35.20 433HWBR25SHBA 400/Case 30.13 317902 25.78 425BIFS 44.12 850425
30                

CASES

BROWN PAPER BAG #2, 500/CS 13.17 VB2SOB 10.35 433BR2BGC 9.99 136190B 7.70 2BIFS 17.33 850402
8                

CASES

1/2 FOLD TOILET SEAT COVERS,                                                                                       

20 PACKS OF 250 SHEETS/PK
36.46 GJ010150 39.88 SHIELD 29.64 53500020 28.10 666902 24.52 PM0100 32.33 850999

20                

CASES

LOW BID

SECOND LOWEST BID

IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO LLC
IMPERIAL VALLEY DISTRIBUTING                                                                             

(PADRE USA)

DESERT VALLEY SERVICES                                                                                       

(FULTON DISTRIBUTING)
BRADY PLUS ALL SOURCES ALL PRODUCTS LLC

RFQ 25-0255

IMPERIAL COUNTY FLEET, SHERIFFS, PROBATION, FACILITIES, & FIRE DEPARTMENT

NORTHERN OFFICE PRODUCTS AND OFFICE FURNITURE                                 

(360 BUSINESS PRODUCTS)

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026

PAPER BID RECAP

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


