
DESCRIPTION PRICING SKU COMMENTS PRICING SKU COMMENTS PRICING SKU COMMENTS PRICING SKU COMMENTS PRICING SKU COMMENTS QTY

DISPOSABLE EMBOSSED POLY APRONS,                                                  

WHITE, 28" C 46", 1.0 MIL, 10/100
63.41 250-FH3L 71.35 1534-CASE 500/Case 51.66 246153 66.96 15321CS 110.08 DA2846

30         

CASES

NAPKINS 1 PLY TALL FOLD 40.25 57000 32.30 IFS-TFN 32.00 635000 24.73 VBTFN 43.28 KN-F137-1W
25         

CASES

POLY BEARD NET, WHITE,                                                                            

ONE SIZE, 100/CS
11.50 S-9635W 35.20 17908 118.00 666204 38.11 BP4R 4.84 999WH18PPBC

7                

CASES

21" BROWN DISPOSABLE HAIR NETS, 1000/CA 52.34 29166 14.33 12259 144/Box 118.00 666203 1444/Case 31.85 6621 64.10 167BR21NLHN
17         

CASES

10 OZ PAPER CUP, WHITE 40 EA/SLEEVE, 1000/CS 54.94 50010W 70.52 HPI-10HC 44.90 852001 53.76 VBCLHP10SW 69.55 50010RIPWHPE 500/Case
17         

CASES

MEDIUM WHITE POLYPROPYLENE CUTLERY,                                             

T-SPOON, 10/100/CS
9.06 VBCSMP604NW 12.93 9956529 7.45 538016 9.86 U2008W 8.50 U2008W

145         

CASES

MEDIUM WHITE POLYPROPYLENE CUTLERY,                                              

FORK, 10/100/CS
9.06 VBCSMP602NW 11.95 9956515 7.45 538017 8.84 3640F 8.96 U2005W

120         

CASES

CO-POLYMER SPORKS, ORANGE, 400/CS 22.67 20541SPORK 10.52 62500 White
9                     

CASES

CO-POLYMER SOUP SPOONS, 400/CS 9.87 U2007W 26.97 56006 7.45 538019
Medium White 

Polypropylene
8.48 U2007W 1000/Case

9                        

CASES

12 OZ PAPER BOWL, 1000/CS 63.73 REMBEMFB12 76.43 10814669014707 500/Case 56.20 243150 53.20 KEBBR121BWL 66.53 43312LWPBWH
55         

CASES

HARD PLASTIC SERVING TRAY,                                                                                              

5 COMPARTMENTS, 10 X 8 X 1, 500/CS
92.00 164706 134.25 VALLEY 41.88 666740 Harvest Fiber 60.34 BGS5COMPPPF 73.78 395TRAY5

400/Case 

Compostabe Fiber

30         

CASES

LOW DENSITY POLY SANDWICH FLAP BAG,                                                    

7" X 7", 1.5" LIP, .85 MIL, 1000/BX/CS, 8/BX/CS
16.05 H07 15.68 55000012673261 1000/Case 113.60 666422 8000 Bags/Case 34.79 VBPB77S 2000/Case 36.28 130PSB773

400          

CASES

GREASE RESISTANT PAPER, 12" X 12",                                                     

WHITE, 5/1000/CS
86.97 12X12NPF 86.21 12X12BGPF 75.50 319500 89.87 382135 105.23 1503003536WH

7                       

CASES

POP UP FOIL SHEETS, 9" X 10.75", 500/CS 13.93 IFS721 10.40 IFS711 Box 62.86 123790 76.73 59100VB 13.00 FW-AFS201
14         

CASES

CLASSIC CLING WRAP, 18" X 2000' 18.39 21122 16.53 55000013644161 17.66 98884 17.73 18X2M 22.97 18218X2
27         

CASES

HIGH HEAT SPATULA, RED, 12/CS 81.01 SMW1507 85.06 90214 Chef Master
3                          

CASES

SPARTA, OR EQUAL, SPECTRUM                                                               

CUTTING BOARD, 3/PK
51.20 SMW1068 33.85 WINCO

5                

PACKS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 6 23.09 36131 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

5                       

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 7 23.09 36132 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

5                              

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 8 23.09 36133 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

5                                

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 9 23.09 36134 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

5                             

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 10 23.09 36135 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

2                            

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 11 23.09 36136 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

2                                 

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 12 23.09 36137 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

2                          

PAIRS

DISHWASHER BOOTS, SIZE 13 23.09 36138 46.84 WUXVWX 18.15 N/A
Tingley G2 

Waterproof Non-Slip

2                               

PAIRS

IMPERIAL COUNTY SHERIFF & PROBATION DEPARTMENT

NO BID

NO BID

KITCHEN SUPPLIES BID RECAP

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026

APTOS LOGISTICS INCALL SOURCES ALL PRODUCTS LLC

RFQ 25-0252

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

DESERT VALLEY SERVICES INC.                                     

(FULTON DISTRIBUTING)
IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO LLC

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

IMPERIAL VALLEY DISTRIBUTING                                   

(PADRE USA)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID



PVC KNEE BOOT, SIZE 13 22.99 18821/13 33.65 HEARTLAND
7                

EACH

LARGE HINGED LID COMPART PLATE,                                                                       

9 1/4 " X 9 1/4" X 3
60.32 FC993-3 53.64 24201 29.95 9580006 MFPP 3 Compartment 24.84 SN200V 200/Pack

60         

CASES

6 INCH PAPER PLATE 1000 CT 20.15 21035 19.63 21035 39.65 899003 Harvest Fiber 21.33 6S1M
20         

CASES

BLACK LINER 40 X 46 100 CT 22.77 30821 24.20 703084 22.25 158630 19.48 VBLH404610B 17.50 ECI404612
60          

CASES

CLEAR LINER 30 X 37 500 CT 28.49 HD30378R 19.83 704522 19.35 800004 21.59 EC3037N10 20.76 S303710N
40          

CASES

POLY ZIP BAG 9" X 12" 56.29 213437 31.14 IFS-119 10" x 12" 63.50 144760 1000/Case 60.27 F20912
15          

CASES

POLY ZIP BAG 7" X 9" 24.71 7X9-1 31.49 654866012181 6" x 6" 45.35 153350 1000/Case 23.58 F20708
7" x 8"                          

1000/Case

15         

CASES

8" X 4" X 3.5" GRILL BRICK,                                                                            

BLACK, 12/CS
30.50 GRILL-BRIK 28.10 GRILL-BRIK 26.45 342300

5                    

EACH

LOW BID

SECOND LOWEST BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID NO BID


