IMPERIAL COUNTY SHERIFF, PUBLIC WORKS, & FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
CLEANING & DISINFECTANT SUPPLIES BID RECAP

FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026
RFQ 25-0251

IMPERIAL VALLEY DISTRIBUTING

ALL SOURCES ALL PRODUCTS LLC

DESERT VALLEY SERVICES INC

VERITIV

VIDL SOURCING LLC

IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER CO LLC

(PADRE USE) (FULTON DISTRIBUTING)
DESCRIPTION PRICING sku COMMENTS PRICING sku COMMENTS PRICING kU COMMENTS PRICING sk COMMENTS PRICING sku COMMENTS PRICING sku COMMENTS ary
HAND SOAP, ANTIBACTERIAL, 4/1GAL/CS 5445 50401 3915 38004008 3360 666439 6321 10779897 NoBID 55.93 L0035 caes
LAUNDRY DETERGENT, HEAVY DUTY, 5035 70601 55.04 530104 3151 686860 5791 10820262 NoBID 4370 104100ET105 %
uQUID 4/16AL/CS cases
DISH AP, DAWN TOUGH ON GREASE OR 4132 13032503 7889 DAWNL 3401 912001 6131 10220998 NoBID 6871 PG14501 46
APPROVED EQUAL(___02/GAL GAL
WHITE OR PINK, LOTION HAND SOAP FOR DISPENSERS, 3496 13108912 5818 G010910612 3936 533500 NoBID NoBID 3084 PG14501 0
500 ML, 12 CONTAINERS/CASE cases
(GLISTEN PINK PEARL LOTION SOAP, 12/C5 3496 13108912 5818 6010910612 3936 533500 NOBID NoBID 3984 PG14501 c:;‘zs
GUSTEN PINK ALMONO LOTION HAND S04 2330 13020203 3993 100028 2536 666143 25.00 10516988 NoBID 1604 1019PINK 10
WITH LANOLIN, /1 GAL/CS cases
HAND DISH DETERGENTSU8S & 2798 60201 1 callon 5322 DAWN 8/case 3801 912001 44.00 10820265 NoBID 4691 10139 4/1Gallon 3
PAN CLEANER 4/case cases
KRESTO HEAVY GREASE HAND CLEANDER 76.22 44623 2t 5657 381083 2Gallons/Case 17262 912317 4/1Gallon 8623 10062551 4/case NoBID 6884 2800 471 Gallon 2
a/case cases
SCOTCHBRITE, OR APPROVED EQUA, 4585 3M20688 13.80 350474 1285 146150 a1 10860682 NoBID 620 VBg6MSP 0
SPONGES, 3.5¥6 MEDIUM DUTY, 20/PK PACK
SN SCRUBBING SPONGES, PREMIUM, 20/C5 4585 3m20688 6080 350260 1957 142590 2170 10860703 NOBID 3220 THREHDS 3pack 2
SCRUB BRUSH PRGN HANDLE, TRM LENGTH 17 212 310106 382 2060673 254 8881288 346 10091621 NOBID NOBID o
SCRUB BRUSH 3* IRON HANDLE, TRIV LENGTH 1° No BID 327 JETSCRUB NOBID 346 10091621 6 NoBID NO BID E:EC“H
COTTON CUT END WET MOPS, 420 37650 284 ECoac2aN an 2438308 NoBID NoBID 683 45068€A 0
-PLY COTION YARN, 124 EACH
LOOPED END WEY MOPS, & LY BLEND YARN, 1008 37831 386 650350 626 1163108 NoBID NoBID 5149 CFLGMOP 12/Case 50
HEADBAND, LARGE, BLUE EACH
24" STRAIGHT RUBBER SQUEEGEE 2845 3656814 14.47 MNEC4124TP NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID E:zn
THAEADED UTIITY PAD HOLDER, 836 370709 407 2000068 895 685482 NOBID NOBID 432 200068 100
35/8°X91/2 EACH
X307 BROWN UTILITY PAD, 2050 31447 3333 7100341164 2345 666579 2014 10860688 NoBiD NoBID 40
HeAVY DUTY, 20/cs EACH
WET FLOORSIGNS, STAND, 11X 25° 11.92 46006 1164 364979 128 264343 1224 10042149 NoBID 1741 oce11277 . :gn
STREET BROOMS, BRU 7116, O 1084 130216 14.46 2055209 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 12
APPROVED EQUAL EACH
FLAGGED ANGLER BROOM, 862 433312 4 Handle 598 BIG-BRUT 1096 1657188 525 20070994 NoBID 1196 91351 50
WOOD HANDLE, BLACK EACH
24" TAMIPICO PUSH BROOM, BLACK 15.98 100224 1332 4224 19.11 3108018 10.76 10779788 NOBID NO BID E:zn
36" PUSH 8ROOM 273 101036 2627 MN2236 31.90 211449 NoBID NoBID NO BID E:én
HEAVY DUTY WIDE ANGLE PUSH SROOM BRACE 350 300200 421 2055401 12/Case NOBID NOBID NOBID 119 91351 C:SES
12° HEAVY DUTY PLASTIC DUST PAN 1199 410112 4.26 280169PAN 485 888679 4.26 10058089 NOBID 449 280169PAN E:zn
INDUSTRIAL DUST HEADS, UNS 1018 NOBID NOBID NOBID 10
L USTHEAS, U1 633 20418759 535 4822048 369 | DMTL13S18W 12/Case ea
12 OSTRICH FEATHER DUSTER 562 D12EC 12/Case 986 180020 615 712121 1344 10042424 3 NOBID 1256 4600 E:;H
ITRUS ORANGE HAND CLEARNER WITH PUMICE 9195 0955-04 1 Gallon 57.79 6010095712 12/case NOBID 7376 10062520 NoBID NoBID s
4/case cases
AAX, OR APPROVED EQUAL, INSTITUTIONAL ABRASIVE NOBID 1
CLEANER WITH OXYGEN BLEACH, 12/21 0Z/CS 5564 138CP14278 20/case 4362 870211 3375 348300 223 10032717 2088 AAXB e
"PINE CLEANER DEODORIZER, GLISTEN, 4/1 GAL/CS 27.38 13010843 3555 001030 3028 666910 3167 10817282 NOBID 3649 0010303649 c::is
(GLASS CLEANER CONCENTRATE, ACCURATE, 4/1 GAL/CS 47.20 81101 5972 950101 2148 988806 2453 10817866 NOBID 3427 700008 s
BLEACH, GERMICIOAL EPA 6%,4/1 GAL/CS 216 99991500 6/case 235 PUREBRIGHTGL 6 Gallon/Case 1195 349900 2353 10541147 NOBID 2278 PUREBRIGHTS ns
GUSTEN WASH & WAX CAR WASH CONCENTRATE, 5120 13038153 5671 00050 NoBID NosID NosID 5424 00050 cnoes
GLISTEN LIME REMOVER AND DESCALER, 4/1 GALICS 4663 13020683 6159 1030614 39.40 180077 4361 10818067 NoBID un 10149 o
SHOWER CONTROL HEAVY DUTY CLEANER 3976 13031183 ‘;ca”"" 3381 DVOCBDS40281 4962 122795 3671 10818106 12a1/case NoBID 46.41 600510 12a1/case cns
ase
FURNITURE POLISH LEMON OIL 59 10101 572 62338.75143 4450 168230 64.89 20081618 NosID 4973 F00125 E:c“
EPISAN HAND GEL, /1 1/C5 NOBID 13339 416308 NoBID 6497 10568320 120z NosID NO BID cames
URINALTRAP WISCREENS, 12/CS 2136 82085 1289 160221 39.10 112405 2176 11083647 NOBID 2007 USBWKNUS s
21 PRO PLUNGER WITH PLASTIC HANDLE 558 510209 9 653 520PLUNG NOBID 581 10132471 NOBID 617 520PLUNG et
60" METAL TP THREADED WOOD HANDLE 12/CS 426 PM70303 a7 1365TKB 499 1175918 616 10067893 NosID 402 1365TKB cames
60 FIBERGLASS HANDLE, PLASTIC THREADED 936 PM70213 1079 24420001 69 1175928 1712 20048511 NoBID 1299 1FSHPY ot
FIBERGLASS EASY CHANGE WET MOP HANDLE 60' 128 HPCEOF 1329 4061HANDLE 1473 8484848 1615 10043094 NoBID 1195 96516 e




60" YELLOW FIBERGLASS HANDLE, THREADED 936 PM70213 636 650050 699 1175928 1563 20042966 NOBID 1299 1FSHPY oo
TRIGGER PLASTICSPRAY BOTTLE, 32 02 095 s5032W6 081 890040 089 995879 071 10132507 NOBID 085 120125 v
5 CONTOURTRIGGER SPRAY FOR 32 0Z BOTTLES 140 110542 on 110508 085 985879 069 10132605 NoBID 076 59008 :C“H
PURELLINSTANT HAND SANITZER 4 07, 24/a 02/CS 7499 965124 6791 601965124 NOBID 6001 10039498 6287 34404 64.00 965124 o :;’Es
PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 8 0Z, 12 -8 02/CS 9.18 301512 504 375469 1202 377 961099 541 10499244 120z NOBID NOBID o ::Es
PURELL, ADV INSTANT HAND SANITIZER PUMP 4/2L/CS 23.89 5015-04 151 6125 G0J-9625-04-CASE NOBID 1693 20086923 NOBID 11150 | GOJ09659 81/Case o :sszs
PURELL, SANIZING WIPES, 270 SHEETS/CONTAINER, 99,80 9113-06 8098 519039 NOBID 8449 10550422 9115 1042480 8892 911306 60
s CoNTANERS/CASE cases
PURELL 1000 ML REFILLS HAND SANITIZER, 4/CS No BID 1612 416308 NOBID 277 20015034 8/case 6190 1041895 1394 GOJ0417108 c:;’zs
INSTANT FOAM HAND SANITIZER 72.79 51901 1Gallon 57.10 DIA06040 4/Case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2
4/Case cases
DISINFECTANT SPRAY, CRISP LINEN SCENT OR EQUAL, 3268 1334100 16502 1o/case| 2156 160163 100z 2135 155583 6136 2009190245000 NOBID 59.59 cL1001 2
. 12/cCase 13383 10770896 PACK
ETERED CONCENTRATED DEODORANT - MONGO 645 4385192 e 2569 160011 70z 6/case | 2995 999605 46566 200080131 12/case NOBID 4579 sss05204 s
ase
FOAMY QLAND A, 12 QUARTS/(CS, SPARTAN BRAND ONLY No BID 55.43 1320003 2ar 6474 888503 NOBID NOBID 5843 3200 c’;zs
VACUUM 8AGS, 10 8AGS/PK, FOR NS PACER 214, UPRIGHT No BID 2070 20304264 3268 219104 NOBID NoBID 3371 NSS9691911 nius
‘COMET CREME CLEANSER-ONLY, DEODORIZING, 10 QT/3202/CS 7378 63273163 55.06 PGC73163 56.02 111699 64.20 10939101 NO BID 68.26 PGC731638 o A;ES

LowsiD
SECOND LOWEST BID.




